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On Mon, Jun 14, 2021 at 8:01 PM <ardhiwirawan@iahn-gdepudja.ac.id> wrote: 

Pada 2021-06-13 14:07, IJAHSS menulis: 

> Dear Researcher, 

>  

> Thank you very much for your article submission to our journal IJAHSS. 

>  

>  

> Kindly send the scan copy of filled & signed copyright transfer form 

> (can be downloaded from http://ijahss.in/PDF/Copyright.pdf [1] ) along 

> with bank receipt of manuscript handling charges (Indian Author 1500/- 

> & Foreign Author USD 45$ ) to the following Account. 

>  

> Pay fees Online (Via PayPal): 

> https://www.paypal.com/paypalme/hostingpapa?locale.x=en_GB [2] 

>  

> OR 

>  

> Account detail: You can deposit fees through your nearby bank or 

> online/net banking transfer. 
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>  

> Account Holder name 

>  

> Kausar Habib 

>  

> Account No: 

>  

> 35066992602 

>  

> Branch: 

>  

> Murajhar 

>  

> Branch code: 

>  

> 8751 

>  

> Bank: 

>  

> State Bank of India 

>  

> MICR Code: 

>  

> 782002513 

>  

> IFSC Code: 

>  

> SBIN0008751 

>  

> *After receiving the manuscript charges, we will take your paper for 

> further publication process. 

>  

> Should you need any clarification, please reply back to this mail. 

>  

> Manuscript ID: IJAHSS0303005 

>  

> ______________ 

>  

> With Warm Regards, 

>  

> Editorial Board, 

>  

> (International Journal of Arts, Humanities and Social Studies) IJAHSS 

>  



> On Sun, Jun 13, 2021 at 7:58 AM <ardhiwirawan@iahn-gdepudja.ac.id> 

> wrote: 

>  

>> Pada 2021-06-12 21:14, IJAHSS menulis: 

>>> Dear Researcher 

>>>  

>>> Received your article. 

>>>  

>>> Manuscript Id No: IJAHSS0303005 

>>>  

>>> Acknowledgment 

>>>  

>>> Thank you for contributing your article for publication in 

>>> International Journal of Arts, Humanities and Social Studies 

>> (JAHSS). 

>>> We appreciate your contribution. 

>>>  

>>> We have forwarded your Paper titled â€˜â€˜CULTURING SÅªRYA THERAPY 

>> IN 

>>> OVERCOMING THE COVID-19 PANDEMIC AT THE BALI-HINDU COMMUNITY IN 

>>> MATARAMâ€™â€™ for peer review. 
>>>  

>>> We will be informed about the status of your paper within 5-7 

>> days, 

>>> after peer review process. 

>>>  

>>> We will let you know if you have to make any modification as per 

>> the 

>>> editorâ€™s comments. If the corrections are minor we will make it 

>> at 

>>> our end only. Editorial decisions will be intimated to you soon. 

>>>  

>>> With Warm Regards, 

>>>  

>>> Editorial Board, 

>>>  

>>> IJAHSS 

>>>  

>>> International Journal of Arts, Humanities and Social Studies 

>> (IJAHSS) 

>>>  

>>> On Sat, Jun 12, 2021 at 10:55 AM 

>> <ardhiwirawan@iahn-gdepudja.ac.id> 

>>> wrote: 
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>>>  

>>>> With respect, 

>>>> I submitted a manuscript, as attached for publication in the 

>>>> International Journal of Arts, Humanities and Social Studies 

>>>> (IJAHSS) 

>>>> ISSN 2582-3647 in Vol. 3 Issue 3. Please help for further 

>>>> processing. 

>>>> Thank you very much. 

>>>>  

>>>> Best regards, 

>>>>  

>>>> I Wayan Ardhi Wirawan, et al. 

>> I thank you for processing my manuscript. I am waiting for further 

>> information from the results of the examination from the reviewers. 

>> I 

>> hope to receive information regarding the results of my manuscript 

>> review within the time specified. 

>  

>  

> Links: 

> ------ 

> [1] http://ijahss.in/PDF/Copyright.pdf 

> [2] https://www.paypal.com/paypalme/hostingpapa?locale.x=en_GB 

We have sent the attached publication fee. thank you 
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